ITB 2021-19 - Chemicals and Fertilizers
Preliminary Tabulation -10/28/2021

Heritage Landscape Supply Inc Howard Fertilizer and Chemical Tierra Supply Co. MAR Green Resources LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply Harrell's, LLC
Line | Description | Estimated | Unitof | Package | Product Unit of Total Price Unit of Total Price Unit of Total Price Unit of | Total Price Unit of Total Price Unit of Total Price
Item Annual Purchase Size Item No. | Purchase Purchase Purchase Purchase Purchase Purchase
Quantities Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 |Civitas - Pre 288 jugs 2.5gal. |CIVITAPM1| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 $28,800.00 |Single bid
Mixed iug 2.5
2 [paconil 10 jugs [2.5gal. |47068 $81.29 $812.90|Reject- $208.65 $2,086.50Per Spec. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $208.65|  $2,086.50 |Per Spec $208.65 $2,086.50 [Per Spec
Action jug Not per Tie bid
Spec. broken by,
time of
delivery.
3 [Drive XLR8 60 bottles (64 oz. 59011404 $46.59| $2,795.40 $56.00 $3,360.00 No Bid No Bid $48.00|  $2,880.00 $53.87 $3,232.20 $50.42 $3,025.20
Herbicide bottle
4 Limestone 160 bags 50 Ib. 1550 No Bid No Bid $9.43 $1,508.80 $15.80 $2,528.00 $14.50 $2,320.00 $5.74 $918.40 No Bid No Bid
Dolomitic bag
(Granular)
5 Minors 58 jugs 2.5gal. 200233 $17.86 $1,035.88 No Bid No Bid $37.19 $2,157.02 $40.50 $2,349.00 $26.07 $1,512.06 $23.24 $1,347.92
iug
6 [SedgeHamm 60 bottles (1.3 0z 35720 $51.70|  $3,102.00 $46.82 $2,809.20 $80.90| $4,854.00 $45.90( $2,754.00 $55.23 $3,313.80 $59.95 $3,597.00
er bottle
7 Tiger 90 160 bags 50 Ib. TIGER 90CR| No Bid No Bid $14.75 $2,360.00 $35.97 $5,755.20 $24.80 $3,968.00 $41.87 $6,699.20 No Bid No Bid
bag
8 |Triple Crown 16 gallon |1 gal. jug [11008520 $278.25| $4,452.00 $278.25 $4,452.00|Per Spec. No Bid No Bid $290.00 $4,640.00 $278.25 $4,452.00 | Per Spec $278.25 $4,452.00
Turf and Tie bid
Ornamental broken by,
Insecticide time of
delivery.
9 |Gypsum 160 bags |50 Ib. 902817 No Bid No Bid $13.72 $2,195.20 $22.93| $3,668.80 $25.48| $4,076.80 $26.74 $4,278.40 No Bid No Bid
bag
10 |Zerotol 2.0 12 jugs 2.5gal. 291536 No Bid No Bid $80.51 $966.12 $141.85 $1,702.20 $98.00 $1,176.00 $129.75 $1,557.00 No Bid No Bid
iug
11 |Granule 240 bags |50 Ib. 98615 No Bid No Bid $21.62 $5,188.80 $25.86| $6,206.40 $25.84|  $6,201.60 $27.01 $6,482.40 No Bid No Bid
Fertilizers 9- bag
0-24
12 |Granule 240 bags |50 Ib. 511120 No Bid No Bid $19.59 $4,701.60 $23.17| $5,560.80 $25.45|  $6,108.00 $23.03 $5,527.20 No Bid No Bid
Fertilizers 18- bag
0-18
Delivery Time 3-7 Business Days 2-3 DAYS 7-10 days 7-10 days 2-10 days ARO 7 calendar days
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